
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1087165
Vendor Name: Landmark Ford, Inc.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0339911
Check Amount: $ 44,886.00
Check Date: 6/10/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 144559
Invoice Date: 4/1/2025
PO Number: P0009577
Voucher Number: V0888404

Document Type: AP Invoice
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Fri, Apr 4, 2025 at 03:32 PM UTC

Marcia Wegman <marcia.wegman@landmarkauto.com>

[External] PO 009577 INVOICE

 <marcia.wegman@landmarkauto.com>Marcia Wegman

CC: Mechelle, Valerie <mechelle@cod.edu>, Heid, Dirk <heidd@cod.edu>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning,

 

I have attached the final invoice for PO009577.  Let me know your thoughts on delivery. 

 

Thank you,

Marcia Wegman

Landmark Ford

Fleet & Rental Manager

2401 Prairie Crossing Drive

Springfield, IL  62711

O: 217-862-5253

C: 561-239-3524

 



 

 From: Mechelle, Valerie <mechelle@cod.edu> 
 Wednesday, January 8, 2025 1:01 PM Sent:

 Marcia Wegman <marcia.wegman@landmarkauto.com> To:
 FW: Van Purchase PO letterSubject:

 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, 

opening attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

 

Hi Marcia,

Here is the PO that was sent to Steve. Yes please check if this will still get us the vehicle. We do also have 
trade ins to go with it .

Thank you,

Valerie

 

 From: Kalish, Amber <  > kalisha@cod.edu
 Wednesday, January 8, 2025 11:33 AM Sent:

 Heid, Dirk <  > To: heidd@cod.edu
 Mechelle, Valerie <  > Cc: mechelle@cod.edu

 RE: Van Purchase PO letterSubject:

 

Good morning, Dirk and Valerie - I have attached a copy of this PO and below is what we send over to the 
vendor when we issue PO’s. Let me know if you have any questions or need anything else.

 

Thank you,

 



Amber Kalish

Buyer

425 Fawell Blvd. l  l Glen Ellyn, IL  60137-6599 l USA

  T: ( 630) 942.2216 |    kalisha@cod.edu

 Click Here for current bids/Rfps!

 COD: Check out our  Team Site !

 

 

Dear Vendor,

 

Attached is a College of DuPage (COD) Purchase Order for processing.  

 

Please review the attached  and to the who is copied Purchase Order  confirm receipt  Requester
on this email.

Please work directly with them to ensure this order is processed accordingly.

 

SHIPPING & RECEIVING

College of DuPage requests include the for each  all packages  Purchase Order Number
shipment. 

All deliveries should be sent to:

 

College of DuPage Shipping & Receiving



425 Fawell Blvd.

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 

Warehouse Hours: Monday through Friday:  7:30am to 4:00pm 
 Shipping & Receiving Questions should be directed to the COD Warehouse at: 630-942-2550

 INVOICE QUESTIONS ( Procurement Services does not process payments) 

 

Invoice Questions should be directed to the Accounts Payable department at  or  acctpay@cod.edu
630-942-2228 

 

Please submit all invoices directly to our Accounts Payable Department. Invoices must be sent in P
to  DF format  invoicing@cod.edu  to ensure proper approval routing and expedited payments.

 

Submission of Invoices Instructions

Invoices must clearly indicate Purchase Order Number on the invoice.
Invoices must be submitted electronically in PDF format only.
One invoice per e-mail is required.

 

The College of DuPage is making considerable efforts to move towards a more efficient and 
streamlined process for our vendor payments. For safe, efficient, and faster processing of 
payments, we encourage our vendors to sign up to receive ACH payments through our secured 
website free of charge. ACH or Automated Clearing House is an electronic network for processing 
transactions. Once payments have been approved, they are directly deposited into vendor’s 
accounts the following business day.  

 

 Please submit requests to purchasing@cod.edu



 

Thank you!

Procurement Services

Purchasing@cod.edu

 

 From: Heid, Dirk <  > heidd@cod.edu
 Wednesday, January 8, 2025 11:12 AM Sent:

 Kalish, Amber <  > To: kalisha@cod.edu
 Mechelle, Valerie <  > Cc: mechelle@cod.edu

 Van Purchase PO letterSubject:

 

Amber

On 11/30/2023  we ordered a vehicle from Landmark Ford and the person at the dealership who we were 
working with on the purchase has retired.  Recently when checking on the status of the vehicle delivery we 
found out that the dealership rep who retired never ordered the vehicle.  Is it possible to send me the PO 
letter that purchasing sends the vendor?  It is for  1087165 Landmark Ford, Inc. P0009577 -  11/30
/2023    $44,886.00

  

Dirk B. Heid FMP

Buildings and Grounds Manager

Facilities Management

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd  

Glen Ellyn Illinois 60137

630-942-2574  

 

 



The information contained in this message is proprietary and/or confidential. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please: (i) delete the message and all copies; (ii) do not disclose, distribute or use the message in 
any manner; and (iii) notify the sender immediately. In addition, please be aware that any message addressed 
to our domain is subject to archiving and review by persons other than the intended recipient. Thank you.
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